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XIth Biennial Congress of AETTA to be held on November 20-22, 2017 in Prague 
 
The Association of European Travel and Tourism Agencies (AETTA) will hold its XIth 
Biennial Congress on November 20-22, 2017 in Prague, Czech Republic. The AETTA 
Biennial Congress is a high-profile event that brings together members of AETTA as well as 
a number of prominent guests and speakers. In addition to being a great networking event 
the AETTA Congress is also an opportunity to exchange views and ideas on business issues 
as well as a discussion on the current state of the European travel and tourism sector and on 
its development prospects. 
 
AETTA welcomes proposals for papers, panels and workshops relevant to the travel and 
tourism sector in the pan-European context. The selected proposals will be included in the 
official agenda of the Congress. All proposals must be submitted to AETTA by July 31, 2017 
latest. 
 
The previous AETTA’s Biennial Congress took place on November 18-20, 2015 in Lisbon 
and was attended by well over 400 delegates; some 93% represented AETTA members.  
 
To obtain the registration form or to find out more information on the Congress, you are 
invited to contact Alexandra Goodwing, AETTA’s Public Relations Manager, on the email 
provided below. The last date when your registration form will be accepted is September 30, 
2017. The secretariat has negotiated attractive price arrangements with a number of hotels 
for the Congress participants. Therefore, if you wish to be assisted with accommodation 
please note it down on the registration form. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
For further information, please contact: 
Alexandra Goodwin 
Public Relations Manager 
Phone: +32 (0)2 319 5940 - Email: alexandra.goodwin@aetta.org 
 
Note to the Editor: Association of European Travel and Tourism Agencies (AETTA) brings 
under one roof over one thousand travel and tourist agencies working in Europe or serving 
European destinations. Each year these collectively serve 8.4 million clients, generate a total 
turnover of some €4.9 billion and employ directly 21 000 people. 
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